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ANTH 120 1

Generate ethnographic examples that illustrate the concept of 
culture and demonstrate how cultures function as an 
integrated and dynamic system.

2

Apply anthropological methods such as participant 
observation and a cross-cultural perspective in evaluating 
familiar and unfamiliar cultural practices and beliefs.

3
Apply anthropology’s holistic perspective and bio-cultural 
approach to diverse human phenomena.

ANTH 125 1

 Students will apply a cross-cultural perspective in evaluating 
familiar and unfamiliar cultural practices, rituals, and beliefs in 
the specific culture studied by the course. 

ANTH 130 1

Employ the synthetic theory of evolution to summarize the 
major trends and issues in primate and human evolutionary 
history. x

2

Explain modern human biological diversity from an 
evolutionary perspective, including evaluating the biological 
significance of the “race” concept. x

3
Apply anthropology’s holistic perspective and bio-cultural 
approach to diverse human biological and social phenomena. x

ANTH 131 1

Employing a comparative perspective, analyze cranial and 
dental features of various species of living primates, fossil 
hominids and modern humans ASP

2

Make anthropological laboratory and field observations and 
measurements in accordance with established scientific 
protocol. ASP

ANTH 140 1

Summarize the major goals and theoretical approaches of 
archaeology, and explain archaeology’s role as a subfield of 
anthropology. x
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2

Given a particular research question, identify and select 
appropriate archaeological techniques and methods that best 
address the research problem. x

3
Explain how environmental, demographic and social forces 
have shaped major developments in human history. x

ANTH 199 1
Complete individual study, research, or projects in 
anthropology.

2
Work independently (including self-monitoring, time 
management, and resource acquisition).

3
Apply anthropological theories and scientific research 
methodology to a selected topic. 

ANTH 215 1 **CROSS-LISTED WITH PSY215** ASP, AAR

ANTH 298 1
Complete individual study, research, or projects in 
anthropology.

2
Work independently (including self-monitoring, time 
management, and resource acquisition).

3
Apply anthropological theories and scientific research 
methodology to a selected topic.

ANTH 299A 1
Complete individual study, research, or projects in 
anthropology.

2
Work independently (including self-monitoring, time 
management, and resource acquisition).

3
Apply anthropological theories and scientific research 
methodology to a selected topic. 

ANTH 299B 1
Complete individual study, research, or projects in 
anthropology.

2
Work independently (including self-monitoring, time 
management, and resource acquisition).

3
Apply anthropological theories and scientific research 
methodology to a selected topic. 
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